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Btate of West Virginia
Agency Requestfor Quits
Chamicals

ProzFolder: 750333

_, , Reason for Modification:
Doc Description: Cacapon S Goll Course Chemicals

Proc Type: Agency Purchase Order
Datalasued [Soflcitation Cioses Solicitation No Version
2021-02-01 2021:02-18 1330 ARFQ 0310  DNR2100000003 1

BID:
8ID RESPONSE:

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
PROPERTY & PROCUREMENT OFFICE

324 4TH AVE _
SOUTH CHARLESTON WV 25303-1228
us

VENDOR

Vendor Customer Code: WY 0&?\5 + 000002 (380

Vendor Nafme:  Advanced Turf Solutions, inc:

Address : 12955 Ford Drive

Street :

City: Fishers _ |
State:  Indiana Country : United States Zip: 46038
Principal Contact:  Marghall Klay

Vandor Contact Phons: 304-400-3786 Extension:

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
damis H Adkins

(304) 558-3387 ‘
jamie.h.adkins@wv.gov

!f_g_'i;‘i?f.mx e b FEINg _35-2152001 DATE 03U | 20 &)
I offers subject to all tems and cond|tions contalned (n this sofication
Allowsu:l:::t 2::3! ems af ft bage PO WY PR AP 0
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DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CAGAFQN RESORY '_‘.’sTKTE PARK CACAPON RESQRY STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS Wv  25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv 28411
us us
Line __Comm Ln Dose__ ] ay Unitlesus ___ UnitPrics __ Yotal Price
1 Emerald systemiic fungicidis or equal 14.08000 uNIY 108.33 1,488.62
AGENCY 1 Acre
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10171600 BASF
E.xt’ondad]ba,scriﬁ!im:
Hem No. 3.1.1 _
Emerald systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unitis = or » 0.49 pounds
INVOICE TO B A @bl
DIVISION OF NA DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RES! CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LOB 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV  25417-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS Wv 25411
us us
Line Gomm Ln Des¢ ﬂl]f nit Price Total Price
2 Dacond Action non-systemic fungicide or equal 20,00000 2 bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification “Model #
10174600
Extended Description:
flem No. 3.1.2
Pacanil Action non-systemic fungicide or oqual,
1 unitis = or >2.5 galin
Data Printed:  #aib 1, 2071 Pags 2 FOUE I WVPRE AR 03 1000
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INVOICETO . : ___[SHIPTOQ .
DIVISION OF rwum. nesounces DIVISION os TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR 818 CAGAPON LODGE DR o
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv 25411
us us
Line __ CommLnOesc ay Unitlssue  UnitPrice Total Prico.
3 Velista systemic tungicide or equal 14.00000 untT No bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Mode! #
10171600
Extanded Description:
flem MNe., 3.1,3
Valista systamic fungicide or equal.
1 unit Is = of > 22 bunce
i < |SHIPTO |
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION o:-‘ 'roumsm&maks
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR . 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411
us us
Line_ CommLn Desc _ Qty Unit lasue Unit Price Total Price
4 Podium turf growth regulator or aqual 4.00000 UNIT 144.00 §76.00
Alternate: Armortech PGR 113
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modal #
10171600 United Turf Alliance
g:g No¢. 3. ”1 A
um turf growth regulator or equal.
1 unitis.= or > 1 gallon *

Duis Prigtad:  Fob. 1, 2021
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WVOIGETo

{8HIP TO

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
B18 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS

us

WV 254113300

DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAPON LODGE DR

BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411
us

Line  Comm Ln Desc

Unitissuse = UnitPrice

5 Banal non-systemic fungicide o equal
AGENCY fung

14.00000 UNIT 999.20

Comm Cods Manufacturer

Specification Mode} #

10171600 Bayer

Extended Description:

Item No. 3.1.8 _ _
Banol rion-systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unit is = or> 2.5 gatlon

~TeR

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS

us

Wv  25411-3300

DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

816 CACAPON LODGE OR

BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25414
us

Line  Comm Ln Dese

Unit lsaue Unit Price

6 Signature systemic fungicide or equal
AGENCY

16.00000 UNIT 175.00

Spscification Modsl #

10171600 Bayer

Extended Description:

ltem No.3.t6 ,

Signatura systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unitis = or > 5.6 pounds

Owte Printed;  Fib 1, 2028

FORM ) WV-RRCARF G002 2030705
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INVOICETO = © ~oiesy oo JSHIPTO . . L

DIVISION OF NATURAL nssouncr:s DIVISION OF TQURISM & PARKS

CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK GAGAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAFON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR

BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS Wv 25411

us us

Line  CommLnDesc Qity Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
7 Tertan systemic fungicide or equsl 3.00000 UNIT 850.00 2,560.00

AGENCY _ '

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

10174800 Bayer

Extonded Description:

Hem No. 3.1.7

Tartan s  fungicide or aquel,

1 unit is = or >.2.6 gallon

INVOICE TO {BHIP TO

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURGES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS

CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAPON LODGE DR . 818 CACAPON LODGE DR

BERKELEY SPRINGS wv  25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv 25411

Us us

Line __Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issus Unit Price Tatal Price
B Segway systemic fungicide or aqual 7.00000 UNIT 415,00 2,905.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model &

10171600 PBI Gordon

Extended Description:

{tem Mo, 3.1.8

Segway systenilc fungicide or equal.

1 unitis = of > 39.2 . ounce
Dats Printed:  Feb 1.2021 Fage 5 FORMID: WV-BRGARFQ 002 2030105



1 unitis = or > 1 quart
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INVOICETO R e P |8HIPTO
DIVISION OF NATURAL Rt-:sounces DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESQRT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR N 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv 2541
us UsS
Line cumm Ln Dese 7 Unit lasus Unit Price
9 mitar lnsecndde ~ 5.00000 UNIT 260.00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10191500 FMC
Extended Bescription:
Item No. 3.1.9
Scimitar insecticide or equal.

DIWSION OF NATURAL RESOURCES
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS

Us

WV 25411-3300

DMston OF Toumsm & PARKs
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411
us

Line Comm Ln Dose

Unit issue Unit Price

10 Lexicon systemic fungicide.or equal 14,00000 UNIT 525.00
AGENCY

Comm Code Manufacturer __Specification Mods! #

10171600 BASF

item.No. 3.1.10

Lexicon systemic fungicide or equal.

1 unitis = or > 21 dunce

Dsts Printed;  Feb 1,202

FURM I3 WY-PRO-AREQGY 203005
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INVOIGETO. T _|sHiPTO
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TQURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACARQON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv  z54v
us us
Line  Comm Ln Dusc _ Qy Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 Sure Action systemic funglcide or equal 2.00000 UNIT No bid No bid
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
10171600
Extended Dascription;
mms.‘l A ’
on systemic fungicide or equal,
1 unitis=or » 2.6 gal:gnﬂgl
[iINVOICETO Sl e
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODCGE DR ‘ 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 254113300 BERKELEY SPRINGS wv 25411
us us
Line _ ComminDesc Qty Unit isaue Unit Price Total Price
12 Hamells 26-1-12 fertiizerorequal  360.00000  UNIT 14.65 5,274.00
Alternate:; ATS 26-0-6 W/ZnB 33%AS 33%UREA 33%XCU
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model ¥
10171800
Extended Description:
ltém No, 3.1.92
Harrell's 26-1-12 ferfilizer or equal.
1 unitis » or > 50 pouind
Page 7 FORM 10, W PRE-ARFO-G2 2020708
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INVOICE TO sHIPTD i

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM 8 PARKS

CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

818 CACAPON LODGE DR 618 CACAPON LODGE DR

BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411

us us

Line __ Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
13 Chlorathalonil non-systemic fungicide or equal 34.00000 UNIT 106.60 3,624 .40

Alternate: Armortech CLT 720

Comm Code Manufacturer Spacification Model #

10171600 United Turf Alliance

Extended Description;

Item No. 3.1.13
Chiorothalonil non-systemic fungicida or equal.

1unitis = or > 2,5 galion

WYOKETO e " [eHPY:

DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS

CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK

B18 CACAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR

BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS WY 25411

us us

Line  Comm Ln Deac ) ay _ n Unit Price Total Price
14 Tebuconazole systémic fungicide orequal  T:00000 82,00 1,476.00

Alternate: ArmortechTEB 360 1gal

Comm Code Manufacturer Sptclﬁuthn

10171600 United Turf Alliarice

Extended Description:

flem No, 3.1,14

Systemic Fungiclde - Tebuconazole syetemic fungicide or equal.
1 unitis = ar > 2.5 gallon

Outn Printed;  Fats 1, 2021 Page 8
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INVOICETD ™ TR sweyel 5
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
6818 CACAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411.3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS W 28411
us us
Line __Comm Ln Desc . Qty Unit lssue Unit Price Total Price
15 Chipeo 26019 systemic fungicide or aqual 17.00000 UNIT 149.00 2533.00

Allernate: Armortech IP 238 ‘
Comm Code Manufacturer Speclfication Model #
10171600 United Turf Alliance
Extended Description:
item No, 3.1.15
Chipco 26019 systemic fungicide or equal,
1unitis = or > 2.5 gallon
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT ST/ CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
618 CACAPON'LODG 818 CACAPON LODGE DR _
BERKELEY SPRINGS WY 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 26411
us us .
Line Comm.Ln Desc 7 Totf Price
16 Fluazinam systemic fungicida or equal 1815.00
Alternate: Armortech Rotator

Comm Code Manufacturer
10171600 United Turf Alllance
Extended Description:
ltemn No. 3.1.16

Fluazinam sysfemic fungicide or equal,
1 unitis = or > 1 gaflon

Omis Printed:  Fob1, 2021
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DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESOR_T STATE PARK
818 CAGAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPONLODGEDR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS W 28411
us us
Uine  Comm.LnDesc ay Unit lssuo Unit Price Tatal Price
17 Siibdue systemic fungicide or equal 17.00000 UNIT 423.00 7.181.00
Allernate: Mefenoxam AQ
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Modal ¥
10171600 Quali-Pro
Extondad Description:
Itam Na. 3.1.47
Subdue systemic fungicide or equal.
1 unitis = or » 1 gallon
DIVISION OF NATURAL RESOURCES | DIVISION OF TOURISM & PARKS
CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK CACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CAQAPON LODGE DR 818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411-3300 BERKELEY SPRINGS WV 25411
us us
Line __Comn Ln Desc aty Unitissus __ UnitPrics _ Total Price
18 Triplst selective herbicide or equal 11.00000 UNIT 101.00 1,111,00
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification ol
10171600 Nufarm '
Extended Description:
ltem No. 3.1.18
Triplet sefactive harbickie or equal,
1 unit is = o > 2. gallon
Dute Printedi  Fob 1,207 Pigy 0 ETHELIO WPRCARFQ0E 2050408
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I’JMSION OF NATURAL RESOURGES
GACAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON.LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS

us

WV 26411-3300

DMSIQN OF TOUR!SM & PARKS
CAGCAPON RESORT STATE PARK
818 CACAPON LODGE DR
BERKELEY SPRINGS'

us

wv- 25471

Total Price

Line:

Qty

Unitlssie  Unit Price

19

cnnu'nl.nnm _

A!temate Chem Stik 1Gal

jer-Sticker adjuvant or aqual

500000

UNIT 42,00

Comm Code

lllnufnmm

Specification Model #

10171600

Precision Labs

Emmd bumpﬁom '

ItemiNo. 3119
Spreadar-Sﬁckm adjwanl or equal;
Y unit is = of > ¥ gallon”

[SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
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See attichied document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions



